
$2,534.22 $2,532.87

No.: Description Pricing
Bid Pricing per 

case/lbs

Negotiated Pricing 

- reduce by 0.3 

cents per lb

1
GROUND BEEF DELUXE, 10 LB/BOX 20%, MAX. FAT, NO 

ADDITIVES, FRESH  (NOT FROZEN)   EVANS ITEM NO. 2170 
32.00$      32.00$                   31.97$                   

2 BEEF STEW VALUE, 10 LB/BOX      EVANS ITEM NO. 359067
34.90$      34.90$                   34.87$                   

3
BEEF ROUND STEAMSHIP, 65 LB/BOX (GREATER OMAHA)  

EVANS ITEM NO. 00714  **Per lb** 3.95$        256.75$                 256.72$                 

4 BEEF OXTAILS CUT, 15 LB/BOX  EVANS ITEM NO. 00252 55.35$      55.35$                   55.32$                   

5

BEEF, CHUCK, STEW CUT – ½ TO ¾ INCH CUBES, USDA 

CHOICE, 20% MAX. FAT  10 LB/BOX- EVANS ITEM NO. 

359067 34.90$      34.90$                   34.87$                   

6
BEEF STEW BONELESS, 10 LB/BOX EVANS ITEM NO. 

359067 34.90$      34.90$                   34.87$                   

7
BEEF, CUBE STEAK  10 LB/BOX EVANS ITEM NO. 

NEEDED#### 59.90$      59.90$                   59.87$                   Waiting on response 

8
BEEF, ROUND INSIDE , 20 LB/BOX EVANS ITEM NO. 02390 

** per lb** 3.49$        69.80$                   69.77$                   

9
BEEF, SHORT RIBS, (BONELESS) 10 LB/BOX EVANS ITEM 

NO. 00653 99.00$      99.00$                   98.97$                   

10
BEEF, LIVER, SKINNED AND DE-VEINED, 10 LB/BOX      

EVANS 2560 25.90$      25.90$                   25.87$                   

11
BEEF, PATTY, PURE, 4 OZ., ROUND, 20% MAX. FAT, NO 

ADDITIVES 10 LB/BOX EVANS ITEM NO. 00521 33.00$      33.00$                   32.97$                   

12
BEEF, PATTY, PURE, 5 OZ., OVAL, 20% MAX. FAT, NO 

ADDITIVES 10 LB/BOX  EVANS ITEM NO. 00520 33.00$      33.00$                   32.97$                   

13
BEEF, CHUCK WAGON STEAK, BREADED, SE – 10-LB BOX 

EVANS ITEM NO. 09651 33.90$      33.90$                   33.87$                   

Clarification Information 

Submitted/Needed

GROUP 1 -BEEF

Bid Tabulation - Negotiated 
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Ericka Andrew, Buyer
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1
PORK CHOPS, CENTER CUT, BONELESS, US #1 – 10-LB BOX,  

EVANS ITEM NO. 02830 **per lb** 5.50$        5.50$                     5.47$                     

2
PORK CHOPS, CENTER CUT, FRESH, US #4 OZ & 5 OZ, U.S. 

#1 10-LB BOX, EVANS ITEM NO. 02931 38.90$      38.90$                   38.87$                   

3
PORK, SPARERIBS, 3'S AND DOWN, FRESH  SIOUX ITEM 

NO. 08350 *35 lb catch weight **per lb.** 2.99$        104.65$                 104.62$                 

4
SAUSAGE SKINLESS, BABY LINKS, U.S. 6-LB BOX,       

WILLAMS ITEM NO. 08121 33.90$      33.90$                   33.87$                   

5
SAUSAGE SMOKED ENDLESS, U.S. 10-LB BOX                 

KENT ITEM NO. 08180 41.90$      41.90$                   41.87$                   

6
SAUSAGE, PATTIES, MILD, WHOLE HOG, 50% MAX. FAT, 1-

1/2 OZ PORTION, 6 LB/BOX WILLIAMS ITEM NO. 08130 45.48$      45.48$                   45.45$                   

7
HAM HOCKS, SMOKED US #1 – 10-LB BOX,                     

EVANS ITEM NO. 02262 14.90$      14.90$                   14.87$                   

8
HAM, SMOKED (BONED) US #1 – 10-LB BOX,                     

MARIAH ITEM NO. 02380 *12lb catch weight 3.49$        41.88$                   41.85$                   

9
BACON, SLAB, SLICED, 30 LB/BOX, MARIAH ITEM NO. 

00128  ** per lb.** 3.99$        119.70$                 119.67$                 

10

PORK, BUTTS, BOSTON, B.R.T., 5 LB AVERAGE, SURFACE 

FAT. MAX. OF 1/4" ON SKIN SIDE. 30 LB/BOX, COMFREY 

ITEM NO. 007516 **per lb**  * 7lb catch weight 2.69$        18.83$                   18.80$                   

1
CHICKEN TENDERS, BREADED – 10-LB BOX,                 

MCCLAN ITEM NO. 01322 44.90$      44.90$                   44.87$                   

2 CHICKEN DRUMMIES, BREADED – 12/15 LB BOX    NO BID -$                      -$                      

3
CHICKEN BREAST– 20-LB CASE (48-COUNT)                     

PURDUE ITEM NO. 01057 **per lb.** 2.79$        55.80$                   55.77$                   

4
CHICKEN BREAST, FILLETS– 10-LB BOX,                             

O.K. FOODS ITEM NO. 01321 24.90$      24.90$                   24.87$                   

5
CHICKEN, QUARTERS– 40-LB BOX, PERDUE ITEM NO. 

01349 39.60$      39.60$                   39.57$                   

6 CHICKEN, PULLED P/C, 10 LB, MCCLAIN ITEM NO. 01030 59.90$      59.90$                   59.87$                   

7
TOM TURKEY – 2-PIECE CASE 45 LB CATCH WEIGHT, 

JENNIE-O ITEM NO. 09561    ** per lb** 2.39$        107.55$                 107.52$                 

8 TURKEY BOLOGNA NO BID -$                      -$                      

GROUP 2 - PORK

GROUP 3 - CHICKEN & TURKEY
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9
TURKEY BREAST, 2/9 LB CATCH WEIGHT  THUMANN'S 

ITEM NO. 09480 **per lb** 4.89$        44.01$                   43.98$                   

10
TURKEY ROAST,2/9 LB CATCH WEIGHT THEMANN's ITEM 

NO. # 09510  ** per lb** 4.19$        37.71$                   37.68$                   

11
BACON, TURKEY, PRECOOKED, 12LB/BX, JENNIE-O ITEM 

NO. 00185 48.00$      48.00$                   47.97$                   

1
SHRIMP, FROZEN AND/OR FRESH 5LB/BOX , GUH ITEM 

NO. 01467 **per lb** 5.79$        28.95$                   28.92$                   

2
CATFISH, FILLETS (FROZEN) 15LB/BOX, BAMA LINE ITEM 

NO.00850 94.35$      94.35$                   94.32$                   

3
TILAPIA, FILLETS (FROZEN) 10LB/BOX, EVANS ITEM NO. 

01929 44.90$      44.90$                   44.87$                   

4
POLLUCK, FILLETS (FROZEN) 10LB/BOX, EVANS ITEM NO. 

01870 27.90$      27.90$                   27.87$                   

5

SHRIMP SALAD, (SHRIMP: PEELED/ DEVEINED),  5 LB. 

CONTAINER , EVANS ITEM NO. 08230
6.99$        34.95$                   34.92$                   

6
SALMON, FILLETS (FROZEN), 6 OZ. SOLD BY CASE, EVANS 

ITEM NO. 02050 95.00$      95.00$                   94.97$                   

7
FISH, SQUARE, COD, 6.OZ 10-LB BOX, EVANS ITEM NO. 

0192219 **per lb.** 8.29$        82.90$                   82.87$                   

8
WHITING, FILLETS (FROZEN), 40 LB/BOX,                           

NAME ## AND ITEM NO.: NEEDED  ####### 119.60$    119.60$                 119.57$                 Waiting on response 

1
BOLOGNA, ALL MEAT 12LB/BOX, KENT ITEM NO. 00750 

**per lb.** 3.49$        83.76$                   83.73$                   

2
HOT DOGS ALL BEEF, NO ADDITIVES, 8 CT/ 10-LB BOX  

KENT ITEM NO. 01470  **per box** 39.90$      39.90$                   39.87$                   

3
VARIETY LUNCHEON MEATS, COMBO PACK, 12/1 OZ. 

PIECES (SPICED LUNCHEON MEAT, BOLOGNA & SALAMI)
NO BID -$                      

-$                      

GROUP 4 - SEAFOOD/FISH

GROUP 5 - VARIETY MEATS
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4 TURKEY BOLOGNA 1 LB PKG (PACKED 2PKG/CASE) NO BID -$                      -$                      

5
SPICED LUNCHEON MEAT 2/10  20 LB,                               

FARMLAND ITEM NO. 02611 ** per lb.** 3.39$        67.80$                   67.77$                   

6
HOT DOGS, BEEF SMOKED 10LB/BOX 5/1                             

KENT ITEM NO. 08175 43.00$      43.00$                   42.97$                   

7 HOT DOGS, CONEY BEEF 10LB/BOX KENT ITEM NO. 01470
39.90$      39.90$                   39.87$                   

2 DAYSDELIVERY GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN
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